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At the end of the lecture, students should be able to: Describe the external anatomy of the spinal cord. There are a large number of ascending
pathways, all of which have important direct projections to areas of the brain concerned with move ment. Gross anatomy of the Tracts of the
Spinal Cord. The ascending or somatosensory system will be reviewed in the following chapter. Define Dermatome and describe its significance
general structure of the spinal cord and the descending or motor system. Descending tracts conduct motor impulses from the brain to motor
neurons reaching Ascending Tracts of the Spinal cord. The purpose of this article is to give an overview of the tracts of the spinal cord Indicate on
a diagram of a cross-section of the spinal cord, the ascending and descending tracts. Ascending tracts conduct sensory impulses to the brain. In
this article, we will introduce the concept of ascending pathways, the different pathways to understand and provide context for these with real-
world clinical examples. When sensory nerve fibers reach the spinal cord, they are sorted into different bundles depending on their function. These
Sensations goes to CNS through the dorsal rootSensations from the lower limb are added medially to the central canal of spinal cord while those
of trunk and upper limb are added laterallyFASCICULUS GRACILIS Nudo and Masterton identifiedbrain centers that give rise to descending
tracts which reach the spinal cord. Describe the spinal nerves: formation, branches and distribution via plexuses Golgi tendon organ. Describe the
origin, course, termination and functions of the corticospinal tract (OR Dorsal column OR Spinothalamic tract) Ascending and descending tracts of
the spinal cord. ascending and descending pathways that form tracts in spinal white matter; and gives rise to spinal reflexes, pre-determined by
interneuronal circuits. Some of the nerve fibers serve to link different segments of the spinal cord. characteristics of conscious ascending tracts.
OBJECTIVES. They are known as nerve tracts or fasciculi and are found within the white matter of the spinal cord. They showed that the largest
tracts arose from the cerebral cortex (corticospinal), red nucleus (rubrospinal), vestibulospinal, and the hindbrain reticular formation Collection
neurons that transmits sensation or motor impulses depending on the function and destination. while others ascend from the spinal cord to higher
centers Definitions to bring home. Ascending pathways transport sensory information in afferent Ascending tracts are sensory pathways that begin
at the spinal cord and stretch all the way up to the cerebral cortex. As the name suggests, the ascending tracts of the spinal cord ascend from The
central nervous system uses ascending and descending pathways to communicate with the external environment. GROSS ANATOMY Their
central processes enter the spinal cord via the dorsal root and divide into ascending & descending branches for few segments, These fibers run in
the dorsolateral / Ascending pathways. Collection of nerve cell bodies in the PNS, Describe the internal anatomy of the spinal cord. In this These
have been collectively called the ascending and descending tracts of the spinal cord, respectively. Describe the spinal nerves: formation, branches
and distribution via plexuses. There are three types of ascending tracts, dorsal columnmedial lemniscus system, spinothalamic (or anterolateral)
system, and spinocerebellar system ANATOMY OF SPINAL CORD. Khaleel Alyahya, PhD, MEd King Saud University School of Medicine
@khaleelya. The tracts are responsible for carrying sensory and motor stimuli to and from the periphery (respectively). Describe the internal
anatomy of the spinal cord.


