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I accidentally hit myself on the head I gave myself a haircut. Elementary level esl 4 tasksFill in the blanks with I, me, my, mine (1 easy
andmoderate), underline the correct answer and cross out the wrong answers. This interactive exercise helps you learn the difference between I,
me, my, mine. English pronouns: personal, possessive, relative, indefinite, reflexive, demonstrative Lucy and won't go. For emphasis – when you
want to emphasize the “I”. (Section A) reflexive pronouns (myself, herself,) genitive s: Charlie’s finger Charlie’s (is/has got) (It’s a ball They refer
back to a noun already mentioned. Index of contents To have the Ss be able to use the pronouns effectively (especially my & mine)PERSONAL
PRONOUNS Give Ss worksheet. (This means I cut MY own hair) I accidentally cut myself with the scissors. Cheers. Pronouns Chart They,
Them, Their, Theirs, Themselves Subject, object, possessive, reflexive pronouns Determiners and pronouns exercisespersonal and possessive: I,
me, my, mine. In “ I, My, Me, Mine, Myself: Exercises “, you will have the Multiple choice The word myself is used in two cases: As a reflexive
pronoun – when “I” is both the subject AND the object. Please, tell (I) _____ when to callWe need to discuss (they) _____ offerIs this idea
(they) _____?(we) _____ family is Me, Myself, and I. Summer Me, myself and I are all first person singular pronouns that refer to the same
person (you), but which word you choose depends on the context Mixed pronouns exercises. I baked this cake myself! A. I Mastering personal
pronouns is crucial for effective communication in English as an Additional Language (EAL). The document provides exercises to practice using
first, second, and third person pronouns like I/me/my/mine, you/your/yours, and he/she/him/her/his/hers in different contexts A selection of English
ESL mymine printables OBJECTIVES: To introduce the various personal pronouns. A. I B. me C. myselfIt was _____ who ate your leftover
slices of pepperoni pizza. Level: elementaryDirections: Fill in the blanks with the appropriate choices—I, me, my, mine, or myself. Personal and
possessive pronounswrite: I, me, my, mine. Check your answers with the interactive version of the exerciseTo complete our Egyptian mummy
costumes, Lou Ellen and _____ bought apack of toilet paper. To introduce thedemonstrative pronouns (this, that, these, those) To have the Ss be
able to use the Тask: my/me/mineI want to talk to (she)_____. They can also used as an appositive (renaming another noun for emphasis). In either
case, the correct reflexive pronoun to use is myself when you are referring back to yourself in a sentence in which you already used I or me.
Understanding when and how to use these pronouns can significantly enhance your language skills. Among the commonly used pronouns are “I,
me, my, mine, myself.”. Do sections A,B,C– Give handout and fill in chart by eliciting/providing the pronouns.


