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There are two basic ways that weathering occurs in nature Sedimentary rocks are formed by the lithification of inorganic and/or organic sediments,
or as chemical precipitates. They are composed by sediments, this is material that has Characteristics of Sedimentary Rocks Deposited at the
earth’s surface by wind, water, glacier ice, or biochemical processes Typically deposited in strata (layers) under cool sedimentary rock.
SEDIMENTARY STRUCTURESINTRODUCTIONYou might have heard us define structure in rocks as rock geometry on a scale much larger
than grains Sedimentary Rocks (aka: Soft rock) Sedimentary rocks are composed of sediment, all solid particles derived by mechanical and
chemical weathering as well as minerals Sedimentary rocks are formed by the lithification of inorganic and/or organic sediments, or as chemical
precipitates. Sedimentary rocks are composed of pieces of other rocks, which are broken down by a process called weathering. There are two
types of sedimentary rocks: Clastic and Sedimentary rocks are formed near or at the surface of the earth. LectureThe Nature, Description, and
Classification of Sediments (PDFMB) LecturePhysics of Sedimentation (PDFMB) (PDFMB) LectureSedimentary Structures (PDFMB) Lectures
Siliciclastic Rocks (PDFMB) Sedimentary Rocks (aka: Soft rock) Sedimentary rocks are composed of sediment, all solid particles derived by
mechanical and chemical weathering as well as minerals precipitated from solution by chemical or biochemical processes. They are derived from
preexisting source rocks. (glaciers), etc., or formed by chemical precipitation from solutions The accumulation of plant matter, such as at the
bottom of a swamp, is referred to as organic sedimentation. Wicander & Monroe () Introduction SEDIMENTARY
STRUCTURESINTRODUCTIONYou might have heard us define structure in rocks as rock geometry on a scale much larger than grains
Characteristics of Sedimentary Rocks Deposited at the earth’s surface by wind, water, glacier ice, or biochemical processes Typically deposited in
strata (layers) under cool surface conditions. There are two types of sedimentary rocks: Clastic and Chemical Clastic sedimentary rocks form
when existing parent rock material is weathered, fragmented, transported, and deposited in layers that compact Lecture Notes. Thus, there
aremajor types of sedimentary rocks: Clastic Sedimentary Rocks, Chemical Sedimentary Rocks, Biochemical Sedimentary Rocks, and Organic
Sedimentary Rocks This is in contrast to stratified volcanic rock (tuff), which has a hot origin Sedimentary rocks are formed near or at the surface
of the earth. They are derived from preexisting source rocks. They are composed by sediments, this is material that has been weathered,
transported and deposited by processes such as running water (rivers) glaciation. Careful examination of the mineral composition and texture of
many sedimentary rocks provides clues to the: (1) original source of the sediment West Virginia University The fundamental factors controlling the
form and content of sedimentary rocks are the location and extent of tectonism, the processes operating within the contemporary Sedimentary
rocks are formed by the weathering, erosion, deposition, and lithification of sediments.


