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WINE Chocolate Stampede Six kinds of chocolate with vanilla bean ice cream Chili Cheese Fries. $ Firecracker Chicken Wraps. Cal: Menu
prices for alcoholic beverages do not include% liquor by the drink tax and sales tax. LongHorn Steakhouse is an American casual dining
steakhouse restaurant chain with locations throughout the United States and other Last Updated on Jby Shari Mason. Loaded with Texas style all-
beef chili, topped with aged cheddar, four-cheese sauce, smoky bacon and spicy jalapeños. Here are the current menu prices in addition to my
favorite happy hour deals and lunch specials at LongHorn Steakhouse in CalChop Steak*oz| Freshly ground and smothered with grilled
mushrooms, sautéed onions, and savory garlic herb sauce. rust. CaFirecracker Chicken Wraps Spicy chicken and Find your local LongHorn
Steakhouse menu. Seasoned Steakhouse Wings Crispy chicken wings tossed in our signature seasoning, served with housemade blue cheese
dressing and Buffalo sauce LongHorn Steakhouse menu prices including kids, lunch & dinner menus for steak, burgers, sandwiches, salads, sides,
and drinks The LongHorn®*oz| Got the biggest steak in the game wearing our name! Surf & Surf || Grilled Shrimp and Blue Crab in an indulgent
cheese dip, seasoned with Old Bay and served with crispy flatbread chips. Our porterhouse combines a bone-in strip and a tender filet into one
thick cut. LongHorn Steakhouse, a prominent casual dining chain in America, is acclaimed for the exceptional taste and exact preparation of s
White Cheddar Stuffed Mushrooms Stuffed with garlic herb cheese and topped with Parmesan. Before placing your order, please review our
Allergen Guide if a person in your party has a food allergy. Browse appetizer and entrée choices for Lunch and Dinner, plus Desserts, Drinks, To
Go Specials, Kids Menus and more LongHorn Steakhouse offers so much more than their impressive lineup of legendary steaks including entrees
like salads, seafood, chicken tenders, and more. PriceListo search Additional written nutrition information available upon request. Not all See the
full Longhorn Steakhouse menu with prices below. We call these Firecrackers because they’re bursting with flavor! Flip through the menu pictures
with the price list (including kid, drink, gluten-free, happy hour, catering, and takeout menus when applicable) Find your local LongHorn
Steakhouse menu. Flip through the menu pictures with the price list (including kid, drink, gluten-free, happy hour, catering, and Steakhouse®
Specialty. Browse appetizer and entrée choices for Lunch and Dinner, plus Desserts, Drinks, To Go Specials, Kids Menus and more View the
latest Longhorn Steakhouse prices for the entire menu including bold bites, starters, salads, soups, legendary steaks, burgers, sides, and more.
CalFlatbread Chips While Longhorn Steakhouse Menu Prices. See the full Longhorn Steakhouse menu with prices below.


