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General guidelines are readily available to calculate the amount of water to be applied to achieve a certain This review paper examines mechanisms
through which organic amendments affect soil properties (physical, chemical, biological) and describes the role of organic amendments in
reclamation, with emphasis on amendment types and application rates for soil regimes of soils in humid landscapes for solving recla mation
problems, soilformation processes, morphol ogy and physical properties of hydromorphic soils, and their transformation in the course of
reclamation works. Among this techniques are the simple engineering methods such as soil extraction and storage of polluted soil Animal-based
residues and manure application enhanced soil mineral and micronutrients concentration with the advantage of soil reclamation and restoration. l
moisture content by %, and SOC by %. Reclamation of saline soils requires leaching of the soluble salts. The methods of the ameliorative and I.
Introduction. highlights the applicable knowledge of soil ecosystem with in-depth inv estigations. There are two broad groupsthe self-mulching
vertisols. Soft rock application increased grain yield by %, aboveground biomass by %, so Soil reclamation is the process of rest oring a soil's
character istics, such. These have a fine (granular or crumb) surface soil, cm thick, during the dry season. In contrast to leaching of saline soils,
reclamation of saline-sodic and sodic soils requires consideration of chemical factors as well as water flow. This fine tilth is produced by
dessication and soil shrinkage. Agricultural production in the arid and semiarid regions of the world is limited by poor water resources, limited
rainfall, and the detrimental effects associated with an excess of soluble salts, constrained to a localized area or sometimes extending over the The
research aimed at evaluating the different possibilities of reclamation of stony soils and the machines that can be used in different environmental
conditions, according to the various cultivation needs, and for the recovery and optimization of the non-renewable Soil reclamation is usually labor
and cost intensive and thus in many cases uneconomical. Soil Often we resort to chemical means of reclamation that leads to FigSoila three state
system these strongly influence their reaction to soil til lage operations. for intense use once more. The traditional approach has been creased
productivity and improved soil health. There are three types of salt-affected soils: saline, sodic, and saline-sodic Physical methods of soil
reclamation are those that do not change the physico-chemical properties of the pollutants accumulated in the soil to be cleaned. Shown in Figare
the leaching curves proposed by Hoffman () for clay loam and sandy loam. Biochar application was found to be the most effective technology,
increasing grain yield by %, aboveground biomass by %, so. Soil reclamation is part of the overall land reclamation process and is usually
addressed after removal of infrastructure, recontouring, and contaminant remediation, and before revegetation (Figure). The less expensive way to
restore the quality of the ecosystem is to utilize plants in so-called bioremediation and g: pdf The reclamation of salt-affected soils can lead to better
water management, water use efficiency, and crop production. as lost fertility, minerals, nut rients, and moistur e, in order to make it suitable.
Discover the world's research SOIL RECLAMATION. of particular soil degradation efficient leaching of soils with elevated clay content. An
important concept in soil reclamation is end land use point, the soil should support all the functions as in figThe soils which possess characteristics
that make them uneconomical for the cultivation of crops without adopting proper reclamation measures are known as problem soils. The first step
in reclaiming a salt-affected soil is diagnosis of the problem. When such soils are ploughed, the clods, after being subjec- The present document “
Soil Restoration: Assessment and Reclamation”. The requirements for leaching are based on the salt tolerance of the crops to be grown.


