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View Applied channel theory in Chinese medicine Wang Ju-Yi's lectures on channel therapeutics by Ju-Yi WangRatingsWant to read;Currently
reading;Have read The main aspects of Acupoints, Channels, and Organs have already been described.1,2 We repeat our idea: it is assumed that
through the theory of Channels and Col-laterals Dr. Wang Ju-yi’s Clinical Case Studies: Treatment of Eczema with Applied Channel Theory.
California Journal of Oriental Medicine, Vol, No.1, Spring/Summer By Applied Channel Theory in Chinese Medicine demonstrates how a deeper
understanding of the interrelationship between organ and channel theory can lead to more precise diagnoses and Applied Channel Theory in
Chinese Medicine was developed during Mr. Robertson's apprenticeship with Dr. Wang in Beijing, and is presented in a unique and highly
readable format that preserves the intimacy of dialogue between apprentice and teacher, with questions and answers, narratives, and case studies
Applied Channel Theory in Chinese Medicine By Wang Ju-yi and Jason Robertson. This text demonstrates how a deeper understanding of the
interrelationship between organ and channel theory can lead to more precise diagnoses and better clinical results Applied Channel Theory in
Chinese Medicine demonstrates how a deeper understanding of the interrelationship between organ and channel theory can lead to more precise
di-agnoses and better clinical results. The book is a collaboration between Wang Ju-Yi, one of modern China’s most respected scholars, teachers,
and practitioners of traditional Applied Channel Theory (經絡醫學 jīng luò yī xué) is an approach to acupuncture rooted in the dual research
threads of classical texts and modern clinical application Applied Channel Theory in Chinese Medicine demonstrates how a deeper understanding
of the interrelationship between organ and channel theory can lead to more precise diagnoses and better clinical results From within classical
Chinese medical theory, excavate the ancient physicians’ entire process of understanding the functions of channel qi transformation and the
anatomy of channels. The solid foundation and source of establishing theories for Applied Channel Theory is through “respecting our ancestors,
and searching for the roots.” Channel theory is described by Dr. Wang as one of the 'pillars' of Chinese medicine (along with yin-yang, the five
phases and organ theory), and the essential aim of this book is to encourage students and practitioners to delve more deeply into this neglected
subject Applied Channel Theory in Chinese Medicine was developed during Mr. Robertson's apprenticeship with Dr. Wang in Beijing, and is
presented in a unique and highly Tags Applied Channel Theory in Chinese Medicine demonstrates how a deeper understanding of the
interrelationship between organ and channel theory can lead to more precise Channel theory is described by Dr. Wang as one of the 'pillars' of
Chinese medicine (along with yin-yang, the five phases and organ theory), and the essential aim of this Applied Channel Theory in Chinese
Medicine: Wang Ju-Yi's Lectures on Channel Therapeutics first struck me as having one of the driest and least interesting titles I could Applied
Channel Theory KURSZEITEN: Sonntag,, â€“,University, Chengdu University of Chinese Medicine, Cui Yue Li Institute Beijing).


