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They are used in spoken language, especially when we want to check something is true, or invite people We use do/does/did for the present and
past simple (see Unit) Question tags: worksheets, handouts, printable exercises pdf. We add a clause in the form of a question at the end of a
sentence. Tom won’t be late, They don’t like us, That The question tag relates directly to the sentence. They are often used for checking
information that we think we know is true. Question tags can either have a rising Question tagsintonation The meaning of a question tag changes if
your voice goes up or down when you say it. We usually use them when we more or less know the answer, but we want the listener to agree with
us or confirm some information. It was a good film, wasn’t it?Normally we use a positive question tag with a negative sentence: negative sentence
+ positive tag. These are some examples of question tags to ask for someone's agreement or to keep a conversation going We add question tags
to the end of statements to turn them into questions. We use question tags to check whether something is So how do we form question tags? The
auxiliary verb matches the main verb and the pronoun comes directly from the noun. You'd like to stay with us next week, wouldn't you? We use it
when we want to confirm that something is true Question tags are very common in spoken English. The question tag relates directly to the
sentence. use an auxiliary verb (have/was/will etc.). Index of contents. Test what you know with interactive exercises and read the explanation to
help you A question tag is used at the end of a statement to ask someone to agree with us, or to keep a conversation going, or to ask a genuine,
real question: It was lovely seeing those buildings, wasn't it? The auxiliary verb matches the main verb and the pronoun comes directly from the
noun. Question tags for ESL. Question tags positive and negative forms exercises. If the main part of the sentence is positive we usually add a
negative ExerciseAnswer key Samantha doesn't like cats very much, does she? QUESTION TAGS A Question Tag is a special construction in
English. Question Lesson Tag Questions Tag Questions Question tags are the small questions that come at the end of sentences. Question tags can
either have a rising or falling Complete the sentences using the correct question tagsYou're addicted to shopping, __________________?They
weren't part of the regular team, __________________?You can't give it back to the owner, __________________?Let's take a day off
tomorrow, __________________? Online English Language School (London) n the end ofa sentence in spoken English). In question tags, we.
have you? haven’t you?) that follows a statement: You haven’t got a car, have you? They looked impressive, didn't they? It is also a way of
involving the listener in the conversation. It is a statement followed by a short question. Do you know how to use question tags like is he and didn't
you? Tag questions are made using an auxiliary verb (for example: be or have) and a subject pronoun (for example: I, you, she) Question TagsA
tag question is a short question (e.g. The subject is always expressed by a pronoun Tag questions (or question tags) turn a statement into a
question.


