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― Mike Lew, Victims No Longer: Men Recovering from Incest and Other Sexual Child Abuse. Victims No Longer Mike Lew, The Sexual
Healing Journey Wendy Maltz, Considered a classic in its field, this comprehensive guide will Victims No Longer helps survivors to: Identify and
validate their childhood experiences Explore strategies of survival and healing Work through issues such as trust, intimacy, and sexual confusion
Establish a support network for continued personal recovery Make choices that aren't determined by abuse Psychotherapist Mike Lew has
worked with The development of strategies for recovery from incest and other abuse, particularly for men, has been a major focus of his work as a
counselor and group leader Mike Lew is a psychotherapist, trained cultural anthropologist, group leader and co-director of The Next Step
Counseling and Training Center in Florence, Massachusetts and author of the amazing book, “Victims No Longer: The Classic Guide for Men
Recovering from Sexual Child Abuse.” Mike is a leading expert on recovery from childhood sexual abuse, For me, it is about freedom. Recovery
is the freedom to make choices in your life that aren't determined by the abuse. The first book written specifically for men, Victims No Longer
examines VICTIMS NO LONGER is a gentle guide, a resource for healing, learning, and thriving, helping survivors to: break through isolation,
shame, fear, and grief; achieve This one-day training is for clinicians and others who are interested in learning about male survivors of sexual child
abuse. Now, in this I do individual, couple and group counseling, clinical supervision, trainings for professionals and recovery workshops for male
survivors and for male and female survivors together. Mike will present on the issues and needs of male The first book written specifically for men,
Victims No Longer examines the changing cultural attitudes toward male survivors of incest and other sexual trauma. The specific choices will be
different for each of you; the freedom to choose is your birthright.”. Mike Lew, Ellen Bass. For millions of men on the path to recovery, Victims
No Longer is the next step. I am the author of Victims No Longer: Men Recovering from Incest and Other Sexual Child Abuse (, New York:
Harper Collins) and Leaping Upon The Mountains ( Psychotherapist Mike Lew has worked with thousands of men and women in their healing
from the effects of childhood sexual abuse, rape, physical violence, emotional abuse, and neglect. tags: child-abuse, child-sexualThe first book
written specifically for men recovering from boyhood sexual abuse, Victims No Longer continues to earn praise for both its clinical expertise and
compassionate tone, educating survivors and professionals about the recovery process, speaking to the pain, needs, fears, and hopes of the adult
male survivor Victims No Longer educates survivors and professionals about the recovery processspeaking to the pain, needs, fears, and hopes of
the adult male survivor.


