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It contains questions about plot details, matching synonyms The Devoted Friend: NBSE ClassAlternative English answers. This story is told by the
Linnet and is definitely applicable to the Water-rat. QBriefly explain why the story of Hans and the Miller was applicable to the Water-rat? Indeed,
so devoted was the rich Miller to little Hans, that he 'I should expect my devoted friend to be devoted to me, of course.' 'And what would you do
in return?' said the little bird, swinging upon a silver spray, and flapping his tiny wings ‘The Devoted Friend’ is about a Miller named Hugh, who
professes to be devoted to his friend Hans, but in actual fact he uses Hans and insists on his performing endless The document is a reading
comprehension worksheet about the short story "The Devoted Friend" by Oscar Wilde. The Miller is extremely egocentric (=self-centred) “What
a silly question!” cried the Water-rat. 'I don't understand you,' answered the Water-rat Ans. the story of Hans and the Miller was applicable to the
water rat because water rat was as selfish as the Miller. One morning the old Water-rat put his head out of his hole. English 2nd Year Notes.
Indeed, so devoted was the rich Miller to little Hans, that he would 'I should expect my devoted friend to be devoted to me, of course.' 'And what
would you do in return?' said the little bird, swinging upon a silver spray, and flapping his tiny wings. English 2nd Year Notes. “I don’t understand
you,” answered the Water-rat The Devoted Friend. Ans. Hans and the Miller are the central characters in the story ‘The Devoted Friend’, The
Devoted FriendQuestion Answers. QBriefly explain why the story of Hans and the Miller was applicable to the water-rat. by Oscar Wilde. Ans.
the story of Hans The Devoted Friend. Get notes, questions, answers, solutions, Assam, pdf, and extras of the chapter The Devoted Friend by
Oscar Wilde which is a part of classAlternative English syllabus for students studying under the Nagaland Board of School Education. “I should
expect my devoted friend to be devoted to me, of course.” “And what would you do in return?” said the little bird, swinging upon a silver spray,
and flapping his tiny wings. He had bright beady eyes and stiff grey whiskers and his tail was like a long bit of Get the entire The Devoted Friend
LitChart as a printable PDF. "My students can't get enough of your charts and their results have gone through the roof." -Graham S The Devoted
Friend 'Little Hans had a great many friends, but the most devoted friend of all was big Hugh the Miller. Ans. Hans and the Miller are the central
characters in the story ‘The Devoted Friend’, written by Oscar Wilde. QBriefly explain why the story of Hans and the Miller was applicable to the
water-rat. The story was, one day the water rat came out of his hole and saw a duck teaching her young The Devoted Friend 'Little Hans had a
great many friends, but the most devoted friend of all was big Hugh the Miller. However, these notes should be used only for Questions Answers
from Prose Section "The Devoted Friend (Prose)" Practical Centre for classth, XII, Second Year QBriefly explain why the story of Hans and the
Miller was applicable to the Water-rat?


