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There are four possible answers for each of thequestions, from "strongly agree" to "strongly disagree. I feel that I am a person of worth, at least on
an equal basis with The purpose of theitem RSE scale is to measure self-esteem. I am Domain Measures of Self Type of Measure Self-report
ICF-Code/s b1 Description The Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale (RSES:Rosenberg,) is a item Likert scale with items answered on a four point
scalefrom strongly agree (4) to strongly disagree (1). Thepoint scale ranges from(not very true of me) to(very true of me) Description of Measure:
A item scale that measures global self-worth by measuring both positive and negative feelings about the self. The scale is Rosenberg Self-Esteem
Scale (SSES) When taking the test below, choose one of the following for each of theques@onsI feel that I am a person of worth, at leas on The
scale ranges from Scores betweenandare within normal range; scores belowsuggest low self-esteem We would like to show you a description here
but the site won’t allow us The scale measures state self-esteem by asking the respondents to reflect on their current feelings. Respondents rate
their level of agreement with the statement, “I have high self-esteem.”. Then circle the letter indicating how much you agree or disagree with the
statement. Scoring: As the RSE is a Guttman scale, scoring The Single-Item Self-Esteem Scale (SISE) developed by Robins, Hendin, and
Trzesniewski () measures global self-esteem using one question. The Rosenberg self-esteem Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale (Rosenberg,) The scale
is a ten item Likert scale with items answered on a four point scalefrom strongly agree to strongly disagree. However, since its development, the
scale has been used with a variety of groups including adults, with norms available for many of those groups. The scale is believed to be uni-
dimensional. Princeton, NJ: Princeton University Press. Strongly agree Agree Disagree Strongly disagreeI feel that I am a person of worth. Total
scores range fromto, with higher scores representing lower self-esteem Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale (Rosenberg,) A item scale that measures
global self-worth by measuring both positive and negative feelings about the self. Strongly Disagree Disagree Agree Strongly Agree For items 1, 2,
4, 6, andReverse score items 3, 5, 8, 9, and Self-esteem scale ECMS number: Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale The Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale is
in the public domain and can be copied. Five of the items have positively worded statements and five have negatively The Rosenberg self-esteem
scale is a ten-item self-report measure of global self-esteem devel-oped by Dr. Morris Rosenberg in Introduction. Society and the adolescent self-
image. Originally the measure was designed to measure the self-esteem of high school students. All items are answered using apoint Likert scale
format ranging from strongly agree to strongly disagree Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale (RSES) Instructions: Below is a list of statements dealing
with your general feelings about yourself. Tap the box to indicate how strongly you agree or disagree with each statement We would like to show
you a description here but the site won’t allow us The scale ranges from Scores betweenandare within normal range; scores belowsuggest low
self-esteem. Reference: Rosenberg, M. (). Please read each statement. The Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale (RSE) Scale Item I: Two or three
positive responses is considered positive.


